
 

  

 
 
Our ref:  00019-23 – Doc 832-21 
 
Date: 24/8/23 
 
Name:  
Email:  
 
Dear  
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
I write further to your freedom of information request received on 25 July 20223. I note you 
seek access to the following information: 
 

Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme for the 2022/2023 Financial Year 

1. The Name/Title/Scope of the  commissioned programme in your area 
2. The total number of males who self-referred into the programme 
3. The total number of self-referred males who were accepted onto the programme 
4. The total number of self-referred males who have completed the programme 
5. The total number of males referred by an agency (e.g., police, social service etc.) into 
the programme 
6. The total number of referred males who were accepted on to the programme  
7. The total number of referred males who have completed the programme 
8. The names of the organisations who have made a referral to the programme  

Link to evaluation of programme efficacy: 
9. Financial Contributors:  
(Inclusive of Statutory, Non-Statutory Organisations and individual voluntary donations) 
10. Budget inclusive of Running Costs 

 
 
Your request for information has now been considered and the response can be found below: 

 
Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme for the 2022/2023 Financial Year 



1. The Name/Title/Scope of the  commissioned programme in your area – The 
Programme is called the Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme – The Jenkins 
Centre 

2. The total number of males who self-referred into the programme . The number is 11. 

3. The total number of self-referred males who were accepted onto the programme.The 
number is 11 

4. The total number of self-referred males who have completed the programme.The 
number 9 

5. The total number of males referred by an agency (e.g., police, social service etc.) into 
the programme. The number is 127 (although this is the total number referred 
into the service, they may take part in different programmes within the service 
provision  

6. The total number of referred males who were accepted on to the programme . The 
number is 15 

7. The total number of referred males who have completed the programme. The number 
is 5 

8. The names of the organisations who have made a referral to the programme  

The name of the organisations who have made referral are Children’s Social Care 
(Leicestershire), Vitaminds, Police, Early Help, Children and Family Wellbeing 
Service Leicestershire 

Link to evaluation of programme efficacy: 

9. Financial Contributors:  

(Inclusive of Statutory, Non-Statutory Organisations and individual voluntary donations) 

The Financial Contributors for the organisations who have made a referral to the 
programme – this information is not held. 
All OPCC commissioning Finiancal information can be found on Previous Funding 
(pcc.police.uk) 
 

10. Budget inclusive of Running Costs 

The Budget inclusive of running costs for the organisations who have made a 
referral to the programme – this information is not held. 
All OPCC Budget inclusive of running costs can be found Budget Information 
(pcc.police.uk) 
 

The Police and Crime Commissioners Office provides you the right to ask for a re-examination 
of your request under its review procedure. Letters should be addressed to Data Protection 
Officer at the above address or emailed to OPCC@leics.police.uk. If you decide to request 
such a review and having followed the Police and Crime Commissioner’s full process you are 
still dissatisfied, then you have the right to direct your comments to the Information 
Commissioner who will give it consideration. 

 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner 

 

https://www.leics.pcc.police.uk/Planning-and-Money/Commissioning/Previous-Funding/Previous-Funding.aspx
https://www.leics.pcc.police.uk/Planning-and-Money/Commissioning/Previous-Funding/Previous-Funding.aspx
https://www.leics.pcc.police.uk/Planning-and-Money/Finance/Budget-Information/Budget-Information.aspx
https://www.leics.pcc.police.uk/Planning-and-Money/Finance/Budget-Information/Budget-Information.aspx
mailto:OPCC@leics.police.uk


In complying with our statutory duty under sections 1 and 11 of the Freedom of Information Act 
2000 to release the enclosed information will not breach the Copyright, Designs and Patents 
Act 1988. However, the rights of the copyright owner of the enclosed information will continue 
to be protected by law. 

 
Applications for the copyright owner’s written permission to reproduce any part of the attached 
information should be addressed to The Office of the PCC, Leicestershire Police Headquarters, 
St. Johns, Enderby, Leicester LE19 2BX. 
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